Murray Dahl Beery & Renaud LLP

Attorneys at Law 710 Kipling Street, Suite 300 Lakewood, CO 80215



Ph:303-493-6670

Fax:

November 2, 2018

City of Salida The Touber Building 448 E First Street, Suite 112 Salida, CO 81201

Attention:

P. T. Wood, Mayor

Matter #:

17-269

Inv #:

14857

RE:

General Counsel

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	RATE	HOURS	AMOUNT
Oct-01-18	Discuss audit with TC;research loc gov audit law	GTW	\$200.00	1.00	200.00
	Advise G. VanNimwegen regarding donation of land in lieu of inclusionary housing requirements; conf w G. Wilson re same; research and analyze city code and county commissioner's concern with inclusionary housing requirement and annexation procedures; draft memo to G. Van Nimwegen advising him re same	NP	\$170.00	1.25	212.50
Oct-02-18	Phone conference w Mayor re draft employment agreement w Nelson; amend draft agreement, return to Mayor, Councilor Shore, T Casey and Nelson; follow up emails.	CNB	\$200.00	1.25	250.00
	Discuss Admin contract w Mayor and DN; discuss audit status with TC; prepare e-session materials; attend Council and e-session	GTW	\$200.00	3.75	750.00
Oct-06-18	T/c w G. Wilson re incoming administrator and employment agreement; conf w C. Beery re same	NP	\$170.00	0.50	85.00
Oct-08-18	Confer w Petraro re Administrator selection process and employment agreement; draft and send emails to advise re same; multiple emails w multiple CORA requests received by L	CNB	\$200.00	2.00	400.00

Invoice #:	14857	Page	2			November 2,	2018
		view same, begin dr and advisements.	rafting				
	Beery re s administra issues; co w C. Beer conf w Ju	ORA requests; confiame; address city ator employment agniference call w T. C y re employment agdge Hardy-Moore changes concerning	reement casey; conf greement; oncerning	NP	\$170.00	0.75	127.50
Oct-09-18		nfs w NP re next we neeting; emails re re		CNB	\$200.00	1.00	200.00
	preparation meeting;	layor Wood and T. Con of 10/16 City Couconf w C. Beery resisted to CORA requests same	ancil same; conf	NP	\$170.00	0.50	85.00
Oct-11-18	records re Travis re e public rec	onsive docs, letters, quests, send to and e each; review add'l re ords request, advise emails w Travis, ad	advise eceived re same;	CNB	\$200.00	2.50	500.00
	district ore VanNimw and advise to a new r same; adv procedura and potent enforceme Wood in p Council m	ral business economidinance; conf w G. egen re same; reseate L. Travis on how the equest; conf w C. B ise Mayor Wood regal and public commettal need for public sent of same; conf was preparation of 10/16 neeting; conf watton transfer of real estimation.	rch CORA o respond eery re garding ent issues safety Mayor City rney for tate, assets	NP	\$170.00	4.50	765.00
		ties; conf w Judge r e amendments and p					
Oct-15-18	concerning questions; agenda an analysis; or same; controlled attorneys atto	Nelson re 2017 auc g legal and litigation review 10/16 City of d packet for legal is conf w L. Travis and orrespondence w N oncerning transfer of ity; correspondence concerning USFS pro- l issues; advise D. N	Council Sues and I D. Nelson RCDC of property w roperty and	NP	\$170.00	2.25	382.50

Invoice #:	14857	Page 3		N	November 2, 2	2018
Oct-16-18	review and analyze w G. Wilson re sam Conf call w P.T. We Brown-Kovacic and preparation for 10/meeting due to no a conf w PT Wood re Nelson and PT Wood issues, concerns an	ood; C. d D. Nelson in 16 City Council attorney presence; e IGA; advise D. od re potential legal	NP	\$170.00	1.00	170.00
Oct-17-18	from citizen re vari	or request and emails;	CNB	\$200.00	2.00	400.00
	issues; provide and D. Nelson re 2017 correspondence was USFS building; dra request for L. Travifor same; provide a re same; conf w C. attorney for SSG reand court updates; Hardy-Moore re pachanges; conf w PT request and vandav	Beery re same; t/c we quiet title settlement correspondence w C. arking ticket code T Wood re CORA weer ranch and conf w M. Bowers ress for trademark of	NP	\$170.00	2.50	425.00
Oct-18-18	Review and analyze advise L. Travis on request; conf w G. outstanding legal is correspondence w loutstanding legal is items/assignments meeting	response to CORA Wilson re ssues; general D. Nelson re ssues and	NP	\$170.00	1.00	170.00
Oct-19-18	Review, amend and creating a central be overlay zone district VanNimwegen re sa	usiness economic et; conf w G.	NP	\$170.00	1.00	170.00

Invoice #:	14857	Page	4			November 2,	2018
	and analy same; ad Counciln session a Wilson re	7 audit response lett vze materials and info vise D. Nelson re san nember Critelli re exe nd sunshine laws; co e same; conf w Assist re airport lease	ormation re ne; conf w ecutive nf w G.	NP	\$170.00	1.75	297.50
Oct-22-18	OML issuand person	/LT re elections,COF ues,Confer w Drew Nonnel issues, Jodi Ma tions, PT re personne	N re audit re banking	GTW	\$200.00	2.00	400.00
	lease assi and bank attorney in same; con same; me outstandi and occur issues add meeting; requests a w G. Will same and edit and fi w G. Will edit, draff license for ROW; con review ar	w County attorney regnment; review all reing documents from the same; conf w G. Wonf w L. Travis and Detering w G. Wilson to the same and assignments are seen as a 10/16 City advise L. Travis re Cand certain open received and council memore executive session and council memore are executive session and D. Nelson rest and finalize condition Many Minis on Paterresondence w City and analyze minutes from the meeting	eal estate county /ilson re . Nelson re o discuss and issues and legal / Council CORA ords; conf aber re as; draft, tter; conf e same; onal lmer Street staff;	NP	\$170.00	4.25	722.50
Oct-23-18	process a	OML issue; FCPA c nd DA jurisdiction; c ice and CORA matte	confer w	GTW	\$200.00	1.50	300.00
Oct-24-18		and draft letter to DA ming and prioritization	,	GTW	\$200.00	2.00	400.00
	Minis re Street RC with the C conf w G re same; DA regar violaions election; special el implement	ndence w attorneys from September spectron results in order to recumentation concerns of the content of the con	n Palmer ity logo f State; n L. Travis letter to on law ccial Trais re er to draft same;	NP	\$170.00	2.50	425.00

Invoice #:	14857	Page	5			November 2,	2018
	NRCDC re same	and the City; conf w	D. Nelson				
Oct-25-18	and letter district at issue; rev for love f materials staff mee paralegal files re lo	G. Wilson re CORA restrom residents and storney concerning election in the pre-annexation and research in preparations on 10/26; conficuncerning docume to trademark; correstry for many minis record.	letter to lection agreement eview paration for w intation and spondence	NP	\$170.00	1.75	297.50
Oct-26-18	question : Code, CC advise Tr Travis re	nd analyze liquor lic from L Travis; refer D Liquor Code, State avis; additional inqu new licensing proce	to City Regs, iry from dures.	CNB	\$200.00	1.75	350.00
	legal assi, issues; mand D. No NRCDC organizate City; disconsame; revenistory and transfer; in Nelson; mof city constaff re same meeting where the subdivisors same; meeting where and average issue; meeting wandavee issue; wandavee	w D. Nelson re outst gnment and upcomin eeting w T. Casey, P elson re solar panel of properties and transfition, assets and liabilities cuss stategy and plantage and analyze door in the ward analyze door and memos re NRCDO review election law in meeting re lodging ta uncil handbook; adv and numerous lead w G. Van Nimwegen overlay zone disrict and eting w Councilment and D. Nelson re NRO reproperty and elective thanges concerning mental control of the solution of the manges concerning mental control of the solution of the manges concerning mental control of the solution of the solution of the manges concerning mental control of the solution of the	ng legal T Wood company; Fer of ities to ning for cuments, C for ssues w D. x and draft ise city gal issues; re central and love mwegen on nber CDC, on logo court Judge	NP	\$170.00	6.75	1,147.50
Oct-28-18	Review a document	parking tickets nd analyze NRCDC ts, real estate, legal a al; history and memo		NP	\$170.00	2.50	425.00
Oct-29-18	w transfer Corresponding airport hat for same; re same;		orney re necessary city letter . Scott re	NP	\$170.00	1.25	212.50

Invoice #:	14857 Pa	ge 6		1	November 2	2, 2018
Oct-30-18	same; draft implementing of from last month's special ed. Analyze Travis' question relicense modification of preanalyze and advise Travis; emails; emails re CORA re	lection e liquor emises, follow up	CNB	\$200.00	1.00	200.00
	MJ licensing issue. process Phillips CORA req w/LT; discuss atty RFP, oth DNelson; Discuss NRCDC logo,muni code changes re judge	ner matters w/ c transaction,	GTW	\$200.00	1.50	300.00
	t/c w G. Wilson re 10/26 m outstanding legal issues an for ongoing legal solutions employment issues and NF	d strategize concerning	NP	\$170.00	2.50	425.00
	of property and organization Lynda; review and finalize airport hanger lease; advisor same; draft, edit and finalize conforming results of spect municipal code; conf w G. recent lodging tax ordinate for logding tax on short ter review draft IGA w CDOT same and advise D. Lady re	letter re e L. Travis re ze ordinance ial election to Wilson re ce and option m rentals; ; analyze				
	Research for amendment o works; draft election policy resolution approving same parking in lieu options; res schedule for parking ticket resaearch and analyze othe municipalities approach to ticket enforcement	y and ; research earch fee amendments; r	NP	\$170.00	3.50	595.00
Oct-31-18	Begin analysis of add'l inquartravis re liquor licensing is app process, hearing deadinotes on same.	ssues, new	CNB	\$200.00	1.50	300.00
	Totals				66.75	\$12,090.00
DISBURSE	MENTS					
Oct-31-18	10/25/18 SOS Registration l Trademark	Fee for City Logo		30	.00	

Oct-31-18 10/25/18 SOS Registration Fee for City Logo
Trademark
10/26/18 Roundtrip to/from Salida for staff
meetings 266 @ 0.545

30.00
144.97

Invoice #:	14857	Page 7	Nove	mber 2, 2018
		nts/Copies 168 @ 0.10	16.80	
	October Prin	ats/Copies (Color) 9 @ 0.50	4.50	
	Totals		\$196.27	•
	Total Fee &	Disbursements	-	\$12,286.27
	Previous Ba	lance		16,385.17
	Previous Pag	ments		16,385.17
	Balance No	w Due	-	\$12,286.27
TAX ID Nu	mber 20-1943	771		
		TIMEKEEPER LIST		

CNB	Carmen N. Beery	Senior Partner
GTW	Geoffrey T. Wilson	Associate
NP	Nina Petraro	Associate